
THOMAS CARROLL




PROFILE

Experienced System Programmer with a demonstrated history of working 
in the banking industry. Skilled in IBM DB2, Databases. Strong information 
technology professional with a degree in Computer Studies studied in 
Liverpool John Moores University.


EXPERIENCE

DB2 System Programmer, Barclays UK — 2015 - Present

Working as part of the DB2 team I have gained vital experience using 
advanced SQL and JCL commands while working in a mainframe 
environment spanning across multiple centres globally. Working as a first 
point of support with any Db2 related problem, I have developed a working 
knowledge in incident, change and team management during my time at 
Barclays. 


I also had the opportunity to establish the Mainframe Innovation initiative 
internally tasked with exploring the bleeding edge Mainframe technology 
on offer from our vendors in order to bring the optimal developer 
experience to our clients. 


Key Responsibilities


• Maintain and develop the DB2 area of Barclays Mainframe environment


• Performance Monitoring of multiple Db2 HA/Standalone Systems


• Work with various different application team in order for their 
applications too efficiently and effectively use the mainframe platform


• Track and recovery any DB2 related incident that has been passed to the 
team


• Develop, Maintain and review various internal documentation 


• Accurately preform development, testing and implementation when 
introducing any change to the production environment through 
orchestrated operational processes


• Preform regulatory audit processes and team governance


Mob: +447446875827

Email: 
tcarroll500@gmail.com


Liverpool,

England

UK

mailto:tcarroll500@gmail.com


EDUCATION

Liverpool John Moores University, Liverpool  — Computer Studies 2013 - 
2017

Grade: 2:1


Whilst studying Computer Studies I was introduced to the fundamentals of 
computer programming. With many modules cover both technical skills 
and the social implications of computer, I was able to set the ground work 
for a deeper insight into the computer industry. With many web 
development aspects being covered I was able to develop a final year 
project which incorporated SMS technology with Emails through the use 
of an API.


SKILLS 
IBM DB2	 	 	 Proficient


System Archiecture	 Proficient


Continuous Deployment	 Proficient


Mainframe	/zOS	 	 Proficient


Change Management	 Proficient


Linux	 	 	 Moderate


Full Stack Development	 Moderate 


REFERENCES

Available Upon request
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